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Ruth Pile 

From: greg ward mail [gregward@gregwardmail.com] 

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2013 5:49 PM 

To: 'Ruth Pile' 

Subject: RE: Saltgrass Action Allicance 

Certainly. 

Please terminate the Saltgrass Action Alliance Political Action Committee effective immediately. The remaining $68.70 
will be used to pay incidential expenses. 

Thank you. 

Greg Ward 

From: Ruth Pile [mailto:lobby@ethics.ks.gov]
 
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2013 4:08 PM
 
To: 'Greg Ward'
 
Subject: RE: Saltgrass Action Alliance
 

Mr. Ward, 

Thank you for your message. Our director has reviewed your message and says that you must specifically say that you want to 
"terminate" your political action committee status and indicate what you did, or are going to do, with the remaining balance of 
$68.70. 

Please let me know if you have any additional questions. 

Ruth Pile 
Governmental Ethics Commission 

From: Greg Ward [mailto:gregvvard@gregwardmail.com] 
Sent: Monday, July 22, 2013 3:49 PM 
To: 10bby@ethic:s.ks.gQv 
Subject: Saltgrass Action Alliance 

Please be advised the Saltgrass Action Alliance Committee is no longer active. Please close and remove it from your 
active database. 

If you need something in addition to this email notification to complete termination of this committee, please let me 
know. 

Thanks, 

Greg Ward 
785-766-1739 

7/23/2013
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