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Ruth Pile 
-RfiGttW-E-D'-----­

From: Bud Burke [budburkeus@yahoo.com] 

Se,nt: Tuesday, July 21, 2009 9:36 AM 

To: lobby@ethics.ks.gov 

Subject: Fw: Termination of PAC 

--- On Tue, 7121/09, Bud Burke <budburkeus@yahoo.com> wrote: 

From: Bud Burke <budburkeus@yahoo.com>
 
Subject: Termination of PAC
 
To: 10bby@ethics.ks.com
 
Date: Tuesday, July 21,2009,9:05 AM
 

On my most recent report of the Bud Burke's PAC I showed a balance in the account of $181.85. 

On June 18, 2009, I requested a transfer of the Blue Valley bank to my account in People Bank of the balance 
of the account. 

On June 22, 2009, the $181.85 was deposited to the People Bank account and on the following day I wrote a 
check for $200.00 to The Women's'Transitional Care organization. 

The account is now closed and I want to terminate the PAC. 

. Thank you. 

Bud Burke
 
4604 Cherry Hills Drive
 
Lawrence, KS 66047
 

7/21/2009
 


