
Karina 

From: Ethics <ethics@ethics.ks.gov> : .~ 

Sent: Wednesday, September 02, 2015 7:55 AM 
To: Karina Renna 
Subject: FW: Letter of Ammendment to the January 10 2015 report 

From: Sheryl Siegele [mailto:siegeles@yahoo.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, September 01, 2015 10:08 PM 
To: ethics@ethics.ks.gov 
Cc: Nancy Niles Lusk 
Subject: Letter of Ammendment to the January 10 2015 report 

I received a letter from Carol Williams. I tried to amend the report, but the menu does not 
let me include all of the information that I believe you want. 
In the last paragraph, it says that the information can be disclosed in a letter of 
amendment to the report. I am not sure if such a letter can be emailed. If not, I will make 
a copy of this and send it. I do not have a direct email or address for Carol Williams. 

In the January 10, 2015 finance report for Representative Nancy Lusk, on Schedule C, I 
listed a repayment to Rep. Lusk via check, for $2588.80. The drop down menu would not 
let me provide specific information. Here is the breakdown: 
10-03-14 USPS for postage: $170.00 
10-10-14 Riemann Liquor for fundraiser refreshments: $66.69 
10-11-14 Press Plus News Service: $9.95 
10-12-14 Press Plus News Service: $9.95 
10-15-14 FacebookAd: $26.01 
10-20-14 USPS for postage: $136.00 
10-20-14 Facebook Ad: $52.71 
10-22-14 Voter Action Network (robo calls): $127.00 
10-22-14 USPS for postage: $9.00 
10-23-14 Campaign Com. Solutions (robo calls): $1,758.40 
10-31-14 FacebookAd: $223.09 

I will also put copy of this letter, ATTN: Carol Williams. Please let m know if there is 
anything els that you need from me. 
Thank you 
Sheryl Siegele 
Treasurer for Representative Nancy Lusk 
8232 Marty St. 
Overland Park, KS 66204 
siegeles@yahoo.com 
9137101846 (cell) 
913 538 3778 (home 


