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Campaign Finance Receipts

& Expenditures Report
10/28/2024

Check only if appropriate - Amended Filing
Campaign Finance Candidate Name:Suzanne Valdez
Filing Report Address: 4000 W. 6th Street, B173
Address2:
City: Lawrence Zip: 66049 County: Douglas
Home Phone: Business Phone:
Offi ce Sought District Attorney Dlstnct 7
SUMMARY (covermg the perlod from 7/26/2024 through 10/24/2024)
CASH ON HAND AT BEGINNING OF PERIOD
TOTAL CONTRIBUTIONS AND 'OTHER RECEIPTS
CASH AVAILABLE THIS PERIOD
‘TOTAL EXPENDITURES AND OTHER DISBURSEMENTS
CASH ON HAND AT CLOSE OF PERIOD
IN-KIND (NON MONETARY) CONTRIBUTIONS

7 OTHER TRANSACTIONS

D AW N A

Governmental Ethics Commission

901 S. Kansas Ave.
Topeka, KS 66612
Office (785) 296-4219
Fax (785) 296-2548
ethics.kansas.gov

Termination Report

(Schedulé A) vyiewylpli'int'
(AddLines1and2)
(Schedule C) wewlprmt
 Subtract Line 4 from 3)
(Schedule B) wewlprmt

‘(Schedule D) view/print

$4,188.57

so oo}@
$4,188.57

$4,188.57

$0.00

© $1,357.00
$5,051.46

false document is a class A misdemeanor.”

“I declare that this report, including any accompanying schedules and statements, has been examined by me and to the best of my
knowledge and belief is true, correct and complete. | understand that the intentional failure to file this document or intentionally fiing a

Electronically filed on: 11/20/2024 1:33:31 PM
Signature of Candidate or Treasurer; Suzanne Valdez
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SCHEDULE D

OTHER TRANSACTIONS

Candidate: Suzanne Valdez

Nature of Account
Date Name and Address or Loan Payable
or Loan Receivable

Balance at Close of
Period

Suzanne Valdez

10/11/24 4000 W. 6th Street, B173 Loan $5,051.46
Lawrence KS 66049
TOTAL OTHER TRANSACTIONS $5,051.46
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Karina Renna [KGEC]

From: Suzanne Valdez <suzanne.valdez6@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, November 20, 2024 1:42 PM

To: Karina Renna [KGE(C]

Subject: Re: Terminating Election paperwork

EXTERNAL: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click any links or open any attachments
unless you trust the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Karina,

| forgive the personal loan of $5051.46. Thank you so much for your help throughout these last 4
years. Suzanne Valdez

On Wed, Nov 20, 2024 at 1:35 PM Karina Renna [KGEC] <Karina.Renna@ks.gov> wrote:

| retrieved them! Thanks Suzanne! If you want to forgive the loan you can indicate the fact to me by replying to this
email or amend the report again and use the field Loan Payable and type forgiven. Either way will work.

Karina Renna
State Campaign Finance Coordinator
Kansas Governmental Ethics Commission

Karina.renna@ks.gov

(785) 296-4219

From: Suzanne Valdez <suzanne.valdez6@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, November 20, 2024 1:27 PM

To: Karina Renna [KGEC] <Karina.Renna@ks.gov>
Subject: Re: Terminating Election paperwork

EXTERNAL: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click any links or open any attachments
unless you trust the sender and know the content is safe.

Done. I tried to follow your instructions and | didn't see anything in schedule D to note loan
forgiveness. Suzanne



